
MANIPUR GAZETTE

सत्यमेव यते

EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

No. 174 Imphal, Saturday, July 1, 2000 (Asadha 11, 1922)

GOVERNMENT OF MANIPUR

SECRETARIAT: MAHUD DEPARTMENT

NOTIFICATION

Imphal, the 2nd June, 2000

No. 21/1/2000-MAHUD(MC).-Whereas the Draft Manipur Municipalities

(Election of Councillors) (Fifth Amendment) Rules, 2000 was published as

required under sub-section (1) of Section 208 of the Manipur Municipalities
Act, 1994 in the Manipur Gazette Extra ordinary No. 98(A) dated 27-5-2000

inviting objections/suggestions from the persons likely to be effected thereby
within 7 (seven) days from the date of publication of the said Notification
in the Official Gazette.

And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the
Government on the said draft.

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1)
of Section 208 of the Manipur Municipalities Act, 1994, the Govt. of Manipur
hereby make amendment of the following rules :-

1.

2.

Short title and commencement:-(1) These rules may be called the

Manipur Municipalities (Election of Councillors) (Fifth Amendment)
Rules, 2000.

(2) These rules shall come into force on the date of their publica-
tion in the Official Gazette.

Amendment of rule 11:-In the first proviso to rule 11 of the Manipur
Municipalities (Election of Councillors) Rules, 1994 (hereinafter
referred to as principal Rules) for words "forty five days" the words
"thirty day" shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of rule 12:-In rule 12 of the principal Rules, for

the words "seven days" the words "four days" shall be substituted.



2

4. Amendment of rule 18:-In rule 18 of the principal Rules, for the

words "thirty days" the words "twenty three days" shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of rule 29:-In rule 29 of the principal Rules-
(i) in sub-rule (2) for the words "seven days" the words "fifth days"

shall be substituted.

(ii) in sub-rule (5) for the figures and words "15 days" the words

"twelve days" shall be substituted.

S. K. SINGH,

Commissioner (MAHUD), Govt. of Manipur.

Printed at the Direstorate of Printing & Stationery, Manipur/300-C/1-7-2000.


