GOVERNMENT OF MANIPUR
SECRETARIAT : LAW & LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT

NOTIFICATION
Imphal, M_arch 6, 2020

No. 2/2/2020-Leg/L : The following Act of the Legislature, Manipur which received assent
of the Governor of Manipur on March 5, 2020 is hereby published in the Official Gazette:

THE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES OF MINISTERS (MANIPUR)
(THIRTEENTH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2020

(MANIPUR ACT NO. 5 OF 2020)

AN

ACT

further to amend the Salaries and Allowances of the Ministers
(Mampur) Act, 1972,

Be it enacted by the Legislature of Manipur in the Seven{y-
first Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Salaries and Allowances Short title and
of Ministers (Manipur) (Thmecnth Amendmcnt) Act, 2020,  Sommencement

- (2) Tt shall oorn_e_ into force _ﬁjom the date of its

publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In section 3 of the Salaries and Allowances of Amendmentof
Ministers (Manipur) Act, 1972 (hereinafter referred to as the **™*">
Principal Act), the following shall be substituted, namely,-

(a) in sub-section (1)-

(i) in clause (a), for the words and figures
“Rs. 26,000/-, the words and figures
“Rs. 75.000/- shall be substituted:




(i) in clause (b). for the words and figures
“Rs. 25,000/-", the words and figures
“Rs.70.000/-" shall be substituted;

(iii) in clause (c). for the words and’ figures
“Rs. 25,000/-°, the words and figures
“Rs. 70,000/-" shall be substituted; and

(iv) in clause (d), for the words and figures
“Rs. 24,000/-", the words and figures
“Rs. 65,000/-".shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-section (2)-

(i) in clause (a), for the words and figures
“Rs. 2,000/-" and “Rs. 3,000/-", the words and
figures “Rs. 5,000/-" and “Rs. 6,000/~
respectively shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (b), for the words and figures
“Rs. 1,950/-" and “Rs. 2,900/-", the words and
figures “Rs. 4,500/-" and “Rs. 5,000/-"
respectively shall be substituted;

(ii)in clause (c), for the words and figures
“Rs. 1,930/-" and “Rs. 2,800/-", the words and
figures “Rs.  4,000/-" and “Rs. 4,500/-"
respectively shall be substituted.

m‘:_& In section 4 of the Principal Act, for the words and
figures “Rs. 24,000/-", “Rs. 23,500/-" and “Rs. 23,100/,
the words and figures “Rs. 65,000/-", “Rs. 60,000/-" and
“Rs. 55,000/-" respectively shall be substituted.

-




SU—

. '___:‘_Wlﬁfm;‘ 4. In section 9 of the Principal Act, for the words “Rupees
section 9. )
fifieen lakhs™, the words “Rupees thinty lakhs™ shall be

substituted.

( Nungshitkthokpam )

Secretary (Law),
Government of Manipur

Copy to :

1. The Secretary to Governor, Raj Bhawan, Imphal.

2. The Secretary to Chief Minister, Manipur.

3. P.S. to Minister (Law & Legislative Affairs), Manipur.

4. Staff Officer to Chief Secretary, Government of Manipur.

\5- The Principal Secretary (Finance), Government of Manipur.

6. The Secretary, Manipur Legislative Assembly, Imphal.

7. The Director, Printing & Stationery, Manipur for publication of the above in the
Manipur Gazette Extra-Ordinary and to send 5 (five) copies of the publication to the
Law & Legislative Affairs Department, Government of Manipur.

8. Guard File. ' : !




at




