
 

GOVERNMENT OF MANIPUR

SECRETARIAT : LAW & LEGISLATIVE AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT

NOTIFICATION
Imphal, March6, 2020

No. 2/2/2020-Leg/L : The following Act of the Legislature, Manipur which received assent

ofthe Governor of Manipur on March 5, 2020 is hereby publishedin the Official Gazette:

THE SALARIES AND ALLOWANCESOF MINISTERS (MANIPUR)

(THIRTEENTH AMENDMENT)ACT,2020

(MANIPURACTNO.5 OF 2020)

AN

ACT

further to amend the Salaries and Allowancesofthe Ministers

(Manipur) Act, 1972.

Beit enacted by the Legislature of Manipur in the Seventy-

first Year ofthe Republic ofIndia as follows:-

| 1. (1)This Act may be called the Salaries and Allowances Short ite and

i of Ministers (Manipur) (Thirteenth Amendment) Act, 2020. “m™srermsat

(2) It shall come into force from the date ofits

publicationin the Official Gazette.

2. In section 3 of the Salaries and Allowances of Amendmentof

Ministers (Manipur) Act, 1972 (hereinafter referred to as the **t*">
Principal Act), the following shall be substituted, namely,-”

 

(a) in sub-section (1)-

(i) in clause (a), for the words and figures

“Rs. 26,000/-”, the words and figures

“Rs. 75,000/-” shall be substituted:



(ii) in clause (b), for the words and figures

“Rs. 25,000/-", the words and figures

“Rs.70.000/-" shall be substituted;

Gii) in clause (c). for the words and* figures

“Rs. 25,000/-", the words and figures

“Rs. 70,000/-” shall be substituted; and

(iv) in clause (d), for the words and figures

“Rs, 24,000/-", the words and figures

“Rs. 65,000/-”shall be substituted.

(b) in sub-section (2)-

(i) in clause (a), for the words and figures

“Rs. 2,000/-” and “Rs. 3,000/-”, the words and

figures “Rs. 5,000/-" and “Rs. 6,000/-"

respectively shall be substituted;

i) in clause (b), for the words and figures

“Rs. 1,950/-” and “Rs. 2,900/-”, the words and

figures “Rs. 4,500/-" and “Rs. 5,000/-”

respectively shall be substituted;

(iijin clause (c), for the words and figures

“Rs. 1,930/-" and “Rs. 2,800/-”, the words and

figures “Rs. 4,000/-" and “Rs. 4,500/-”

respectively shall be substituted.

Amesdmentof 3. In section 4 of the Principal Act, for the words and

figures “Rs. 24,000/-”, “Rs. 23,500/-" and “Rs. 23,100/-",

the words and figures “Rs. 65,000/-”, “Rs. 60,000/-” and

“Rs, 55,000/-” respectively shall be substituted.

  



 

”
e
n
e

co
n

.. Amendment of 4. In section 9 of the Principal Act; for the words “Rupees
"fifteen lakhs”, the words “Rupees thirty lakhs” shall be

substituted.

(aae)

Secretary (Law),

GovernmentofManipur

Copyto :

1.

2.

3
4.

TheSecretary to Governor, Raj Bhawan, Imphal.
. The Secretary to Chief Minister, Manipur.
. P.S. to Minister (Law & Legislative Affairs), Manipur.
. Staff Officer to Chief Secretary, GovernmentofManipur.
5The Principal Secretary (Finance), Government of Manipur.
6.

7.

The Secretary, ManipurLegislative Assembly, Imphal.
The Director, Printing & Stationery, Manipur for publication of the above in the
Manipur Gazette Extra-Ordinary andto send5 (five) copiesofthe publication to the
Law & Legislative Affairs Department, Government of Manipur.
GuardFile.



 

 


